
Saxx  
5 ’  L A R G E  A D U L T  S I Z E  B E A N  B A G



Saxx 5’ Set-up Instructions

Washing instructions (cover only): Machine-wash cold with mild detergent and 
hang dry. Do not bleach.
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STILL HAVE QUESTIONS?
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Flip & knead the foam to 
introduce air back into the 
micro cushions.

Pull the cover over the bean 
bag and zip it closed. Enjoy!

Open the cover and spread it 
out on the floor. 

Optional: Use a paper clip to 
open the childproof zipper to 
add or remove foam from the 
liner. 

Unroll the plastic film from the 
foam. DO NOT CUT OPEN or 
remove the protective liner. 
The foam can take 24 hours to 
expand fully, but a cover can be 
applied after 20 minutes. 

Place the bean bag in the cover. 
The liner zipper and cover 
zipper should be perpendicular 
to each other, with the cover 
zipper running parallel to the 
floor. 
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